




Premium Pointe 
Community Development District 

          

219 East Livingston Street, Orlando, Florida 32801 
Phone: 407-841-5524 – Fax: 407-839-1526 

 

March 19, 2021 
 
Board of Supervisors  
Premium Pointe 
Community Development District  
 
Dear Board Members: 
 
The regular meeting of the Board of Supervisors of Premium Pointe Community Development 
District will be held Friday, March 26, 2021 at 9:30 AM at the Offices of GMS-NF, LLC, 475 
West Town Place, Suite 114, St. Augustine, Florida 32092. Following is the advance agenda for 
the meeting: 
 

1. Roll Call 
2. Public Comment Period 
3. Organizational Matters 

A. Administration of Oaths of Office to Newly Elected Board Members 
B. Consideration of Resolution 2021-25 Canvassing and Certifying the Results of the 

Landowners’ Election  
C. Election of Officers 
D. Consideration of Resolution 2021-26 Electing Officers 

4. Approval of Minutes of January 22, 2021 Meeting and Acceptance of Minutes of the 
February 26, 2021 Landowners’ Meeting 

5. Public Hearings 
A. Public Hearing on the Rules of Procedure 

i. Consideration of Resolution 2021-27 Adopting the District’s Rules of 
Procedure 

B. Public Hearing on the Uniform Collection Method 
i. Consideration of Resolution 2021-28 Expressing the District’s Intent to 

Utilize the Uniform Method of Collection 
C. Public Hearing on the Fiscal Year 2021 Budget 

i. Consideration of Resolution 2021-29 Adopting the Fiscal Year 2021 
Budget and Relating to the Annual Appropriations 

6. Ranking of Proposals for District Engineering Services and Selection of District Engineer 
7. Staff Reports 

A. Attorney 
B. Engineer 
C. District Manager’s Report 

i. Balance Sheet and Income Statement 
ii. Ratification of FY2021 Funding Request #2 

8. Other Business 
9. Supervisors Requests 
10. Adjournment 

 













































MINUTES OF MEETING 
PREMIUM POINTE  

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 
 

 The Landowner meeting of the Premium Pointe Community Development District was 

held on Friday, February 26, 2021 at 9:30 a.m. at the Offices of GMS-NF, LLC, 475 West Town 

Place, Suite 114, St. Augustine, Florida 32092. 

 

 Present were: 
 
 George Flint Chairman 
 Owais Khanani Elevation Development 
  
 
FIRST ORDER OF BUSINESS Determination of Number of Voting Units  
   Represented 
 Mr. Flint: I’ve been provided a landowner proxy signed by an authorized representative 

of the landowner of Anderson (1995) Limited Partnership. It represents 150.10 acres for 151 

votes.  

 

SECOND ORDER OF BUSINESS Call to Order 

 Mr. Flint: At this time I will call the landowner meeting to order.  

 

THIRD ORDER OF BUSINESS Election of a Chairman for the Purpose of  
   Conducting the Landowners Meeting 
 Mr. Flint: The proxy names Mr. Owais Khanani as the proxy holder. Mr. Khanani would 

you designate me as Chairman for purposes of running the landowner election? 

 Mr. Khanani: Yes. 

 

FOURTH ORDER OF BUSINESS Nominations for the Position of Supervisor 
 Mr. Flint: Mr. Khanani has provided me with a ballot nominating Owais Khanani, 

Jawaad Khanani, Shaman Foradi, Michael Rich and Kristin Banks. Are there any other 

nominations at this time? 

 Mr. Khanani: No others. 
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FIFTH ORDER OF BUSINESS Casting of Ballots 
 Mr. Flint: Based on the ballot provided by Mr. Khanani, he is casting 100 votes for 

Owais Khanani, 100 votes for Shaman Foradi, 99 votes for Jawaad Khanani, 99 votes for 

Michael Rich, and 99 votes for Kristin Banks.   

 

SIXTH ORDER OF BUSINESS Ballot Tabulation 
 Mr. Flint: As a result of the ballots casted, Owais Khanani and Shaman Foradi will serve 

four-year terms, and Jawaad Khanani, Michael Rich and Kristen Banks will serve two-year 

terms. 

 

SEVENTH ORDER OF BUSINESS Landowners Questions and Comments 

 Mr. Flint: Are there any questions of the landowner? Hearing none, 

 

EIGHTH ORDER OF BUSINESS Adjournment 

 Mr. Flint: Hearing no other questions, I will adjourn the landowner meeting. 

 
 
 
 



















































































































































































































































Community Development District FY 21 Funding Request #2-Rev
March 22, 2021

CAPITAL
 PAYEE REIMBURSEMENT GENERAL FUND

1 Department of Economic Opportunity
Inv# 83735 - FY2021 Special District Fee - 4/13/2021 150.00$               

2 Governmental Management Services
Inv# 1 - Management Fees - February 2021 3,041.67$             
Inv# 2 - Management Fees - March 2021 3,041.67$             

3 Hopping Green & Sams
Inv # 120577 - General Counsel January 2021 3,638.00$             
Inv # 120522 - Bond Validation January 2021 1,777.81$             

4 St Johns County BOCC
Name Change Amendment Application Filing Fee 1,558.00$             

1,777.81$          11,429.34$        

TOTAL 13,207.15$   

Please make check payable to: Premium Pointe CDD
1408 Hamlin Ave Unit E
Saint Cloud FL  34771

Premium Pointe









Attorneys and Counselors
 

119 S. Monroe Street, Ste. 300
P.O. Box 6526

Tallahassee, FL 32314
850.222.7500

=================================    STATEMENT   =================================

February 15, 2021
Premium Pointe CDD Bill Number 120577
c/o GMS - Central Florida
219 E Livingston Street
Orlando, FL  32801

Billed through 01/31/2021

General Counsel

PPCDD 00001 JJ

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

12/22/20 KFJ Correspond with state agency regarding ordinance; correspond with district
manager regarding proposed agenda.

0.60 hrs

01/06/21 JJ Confer with Flint and Khanani regarding organizational meeting. 0.40 hrs

01/08/21 JJ Review correspondence regarding landowner election and assessments; confer
with Dunlap.

0.50 hrs

01/11/21 JJ Prepare for and attend call with Anderson Columbia attorneys regarding CDD
actions; follow up with client regarding same.

0.90 hrs

01/11/21 KFJ Correspond with district manager regarding organizational meeting documents;
confer with Johnson regarding notice of establishment; amend funding
agreement; review underwriter engagement letter and meeting documents.

2.20 hrs

01/12/21 KFJ Record notice of establishment; update corresponding resolution and
correspond with district manager.

0.40 hrs

01/14/21 JJ Review revisions to funding agreement from landowner and confer regarding
same.

0.50 hrs

01/14/21 KFJ Correspond with agency regarding certified ordinance. 0.20 hrs

01/18/21 JJ Confer with Owais regarding landowner issues. 0.30 hrs

01/19/21 KFJ Correspond with district manager regarding budget funding agreement. 0.20 hrs

01/20/21 KFJ Amend election proxy form and correspond with landowner; confer with Fogle
regarding agenda.

0.40 hrs

01/21/21 JJ Confer with Dunlap regarding landowner election issues; review
correspondence from Dunlap and Cheshire.

0.50 hrs

01/22/21 JJ Review agenda package and prepare for organizational meeting; attend
organizational board meeting and post meeting wrap up.

2.30 hrs

01/23/21 KFJ Confer with Johnson regarding meeting schedule. 0.20 hrs
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01/25/21 KFJ Prepare name change request and draft ordinance; confer with Johnson. 1.30 hrs

01/28/21 KFJ Prepare supervisor resignation letters, research funding agreement and confer
with Johnson.

0.60 hrs

01/29/21 JJ Confirm with Dunlap regarding agreement and LOE. 0.30 hrs

01/29/21 JLK Review proposed legislation on CDD officers; monitor Amendment 12
implementation.

1.00 hrs

Total fees for this matter $3,638.00

MATTER SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES $3,638.00

----------------
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER $3,638.00

Johnson, Jonathan T. 5.70 hrs /hr410 $2,337.00

Kilinski, Jennifer L. 1.00 hrs /hr325 $325.00

Jusevitch, Karen F.- Paralegal 6.10 hrs /hr160 $976.00

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES $3,638.00

----------------
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $3,638.00

Please include the bill number with your payment. 

Johnson, Jonathan T. 5.70 hrs 410 $2,337.00/hr

Kilinski, Jennifer L. 1.00 hrs 325 $325.00/hr

Jusevitch, Karen F.- Paralegal 6.10 hrs 160 $976.00/hr



Attorneys and Counselors
 

119 S. Monroe Street, Ste. 300
P.O. Box 6526

Tallahassee, FL 32314
850.222.7500

=================================    STATEMENT   =================================

February 15, 2021
Premium Pointe CDD Bill Number 120522
c/o GMS - Central Florida
219 E Livingston Street
Orlando, FL  32801

Billed through 01/31/2021

Bond Validation

PPCDD 00102 JJ

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/12/21 JJ Review validation report; confer with Flint; confer with Dame. 0.60 hrs

01/13/21 JJ Review bond validation complaint and edit. 0.60 hrs

01/13/21 KFJ Prepare bond validation complaint; confer with Lewis and Johnson. 1.50 hrs

01/14/21 JJ Review revisions to complaint. 0.50 hrs

01/21/21 JJ Confer with Flint and Sealy regarding financing structure and assessment
issues.

1.00 hrs

01/26/21 JJ Confer with Flint regarding assessment schedule. 0.30 hrs

01/28/21 KFJ Update bond validation complaint; confer with Lewis. 1.30 hrs

01/29/21 KFJ Amend bond validation complaint and confer with Lewis; correspond with
district manager regarding bond resolution.

0.50 hrs

Total fees for this matter $1,758.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Travel 3.43

Conference Calls 16.38

Total disbursements for this matter $19.81

MATTER SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES $1,758.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $19.81

----------------
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER $1,777.81

Johnson, Jonathan T. 3.00 hrs /hr410 $1,230.00

Jusevitch, Karen F.- Paralegal 3.30 hrs /hr160 $528.00
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BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES $1,758.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $19.81

----------------
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $1,777.81

Please include the bill number with your payment. 

Johnson, Jonathan T. 3.00 hrs 410 $1,230.00/hr

Jusevitch, Karen F.- Paralegal 3.30 hrs 160 $528.00/hr



From: Jonathan Johnson jonathanj@hgslaw.com
Subject: Fwd: Premium Pointe CDD

Date: March 18, 2021 at 9:34 AM
To: Karen Jusevitch KarenJ@hgslaw.com
Cc: George Flint gflint@gmscfl.com

Karen 

Would you call and follow up on the details of what they need. 

George could you provide a filing fee check from the cdd?

Thanks!

Jonathan Johnson
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
Hopping Green & Sams, P.A. 
 
119 South Monroe Street, Suite 300
Tallahassee, FL  32301
 
850.222.7500 | hgslaw.com | Attorney Bio 
 
 
Notice:  The information contained in this e-mail message is Attorney/Client Privileged and confidential information intended only for
the use of the individual or entity named above.  If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this communication in
error, please immediately notify us by telephone at (850) 222-7500 and delete the original message. Thank you.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Mike Roberson <mroberson@sjcfl.us>
Date: March 18, 2021 at 9:33:09 AM EDT
To: Jonathan Johnson <jonathanj@hgslaw.com>
Cc: Christine Valliere <cvalliere@sjcfl.us>
Subject: RE: Premium Pointe CDD

	No$ce:	External	

Hi	Jonathan,
	
The	applica0on	is	a	CDD	Amendment	and	the	fee	is	$1,558.00.		Please	call	the	Planning	and
Zoning	Desk	at	(904)	209-0675	for	submiKal	and	payment	details.
	
Sincerely,
Michael	Roberson
Assistant	Director
Growth	Management
St.	Johns	County
Wk:		904-209-0593	(direct)
Cell:		904-599-6078
	

From:	Patrick	McCormack	
Sent:	Friday,	March	12,	2021	11:28	AM
To:	'Jonathan	Johnson'	<jonathanj@hgslaw.com>
Cc:	Chris0ne	Valliere	<cvalliere@sjcfl.us>;	Mike	Roberson	<mroberson@sjcfl.us>
Subject:	FW:	Premium	Pointe	CDD
	
Hi	Jonathon,
	

x-apple-data-detectors://1
x-apple-data-detectors://1
tel:850.222.7500
http://www.hgslaw.com/
http://hgslaw.com/attorney/jonathan-t-johnson/
tel:(850)%20222-7500
mailto:jonathanj@hgslaw.com
mailto:cvalliere@sjcfl.us
mailto:mroberson@sjcfl.us


	
Good	news!		This	will	be	handled	by	Chris0ne	(much	smarter	than	me!)	for	this	office.		You	had
previewed	this	name	change	plan	with	our	board,	so	should	be	a	piece	of	cake.		Mike	can	let	us
know	what	if	any	fee.
	
Best,
Pat
	
	
	
Patrick	F.	McCormack
County	Attorney
St.	Johns	County
	
500	San	Sebastian	View
St.	Augustine,	Florida	32084
(904)209-0805	office
(904)209-0806	fax
pmccormack@sjcfl.us
	

	

 
Practicing Law with Civility is the Rule!
 
PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from
the St. Johns County Board of County Commissioners and employees regarding public business are
public records available to the public and media through a request. Your e-mail communications may
be subject to public disclosure.
	
This communication may contain privileged and confidential information intended only for the
addressee(s) named above.  If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited.  If you are
not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the
original message.
 
Tax Advice Disclosure: To ensure compliance with requirements imposed by the IRS under Circular
230, we inform you that any U.S. federal tax advice contained in this communication (including any
attachments), unless otherwise specifically stated, was not intended or written to be used, and cannot
be used, for the purpose of (1) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (2) promoting,
marketing or recommending to another party any matters addressed herein.
	
	
	

From:	Jonathan	Johnson	<jonathanj@hgslaw.com>	
Sent:	Friday,	March	12,	2021	11:10	AM
To:	Patrick	McCormack	<pmccormack@sjcfl.us>
Subject:	Fwd:	Premium	Pointe	CDD
	
Good	morning	Pat,
	

mailto:pmccormack@sjcfl.us
mailto:jonathanj@hgslaw.com
mailto:pmccormack@sjcfl.us


	
It	was	good	to	catch	up	a	couple	of	weeks	ago.	I	am	enclosing	a	draf	ordinance	as	a	formal
request	for	a	name	change	on	behalf	of	the	Premium	Pointe	CDD.	The	CDD	board	is	reques0ng
this	change	to	avoid	any	confusion	with	the	nearby	premium	point	outlet	mall	project.
	
I	look	forward	to	working	with	you	and	your	staff.	As	we	discussed,	if	there	is	any	appropriate
filing	fee	that	is	applicable	please	let	me	know	and	we	will	forward.	
	
All	my	best,	
	
Jonathan	Johnson
.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.	.
Hopping	Green	&	Sams,	P.A.	
	
119	South	Monroe	Street,	Suite	300
Tallahassee,	FL		32301
	
850.222.7500	|	hgslaw.com	|	AKorney	Bio	
	
	
No0ce:		The	informa0on	contained	in	this	e-mail	message	is	AKorney/Client	Privileged	and
confiden0al	informa0on	intended	only	for	the	use	of	the	individual	or	en0ty	named	above.		If
the	reader	of	this	message	is	not	the	intended	recipient,	you	are	hereby	no0fied	that	any
dissemina0on,	distribu0on,	or	copying	of	this	communica0on	is	strictly	prohibited.		If	you	have
received	this	communica0on	in	error,	please	immediately	no0fy	us	by	telephone	at	(850)	222-
7500	and	delete	the	original	message.	Thank	you.

Begin	forwarded	message:

From:	Karen	Jusevitch	<karenj@hgslaw.com>
Date:	March	12,	2021	at	10:55:26	AM	EST
To:	Jonathan	Johnson	<jonathanj@hgslaw.com>
Subject:	Premium	Pointe

	

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. If you
believe this message is fraudulent or malicious, please contact MIS for further
assistance.
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